
 

 

 

For Immediate Release  

 
St. Francis Primary And Carberry Court Special School Celebrate Read Across Jamaica 

Day 
 
Kingston, Jamaica, 13th of May 2024. – Schools across Jamaica including St. Francis Primary 
and Carberry Court Special School came together to celebrate Read Across Jamaica Day, a 
joyful event dedicated to promoting literacy and the joy of reading among Jamaican youth. 
 
The event brought students, educators, and community members together in a spirit of literary 
exploration and fun. 
 
CIBC Caribbean Jamaica joined in collaboration at both schools, engaging students in 
storytelling sessions and interactive reading activities. Among those in attendance were some of 
the bank’s senior staff members, Managing Director Nigel Holness, Jerome Griffiths, Head of 
Human Resources, Renee Whitehorne, Marketing Manager, and Sherian Macdonald, Corporate 
Senior Manager of Deals Management. 
 
"We are delighted to participate in Read Across Jamaica Day with St. Francis Primary and 
Carberry Court Special School," said Nigel Holness, Managing Director. "Events like these are 
vital for fostering a love of reading and learning among young people, laying the foundation for 
their future success.. Education is the cornerstone of progress, and initiatives like Read Across 
Jamaica Day exemplify the transformative power of collaboration.” 
 
Throughout the day, students were captivated by engaging stories read aloud by the guests, 
sparking their imaginations and nurturing a deeper appreciation for literature. From classic 
children's tales to tales of adventure and discovery, the event showcased the magic of 
storytelling in igniting curiosity and creativity in young minds. 
 
Jerome Griffiths, Head of Human Resources, praised the dedication of the schools and their 
commitment to promoting literacy for all students. "We are proud to support initiatives like Read 
Across Jamaica Day, which play a crucial role in building stronger communities through 
education and empowerment. By encouraging a love for reading from an early age, we are 
helping to shape the future leaders of tomorrow." 
 
The celebration of Read Across Jamaica Day at St. Francis Primary and Carberry Court Special 
School highlighted the importance of partnerships between schools, communities, and 
businesses in advancing educational opportunities for all. Through shared efforts, participants 
were left inspired and motivated to continue their journey of exploration through the world of 
books. 
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(L-R) Patrica Ramikie Gordon, Librarian, St. Francis Primary School and CIBC Caribbean executives Nigel Holness, 
Managing Director; Renee Whitehorne, Marketing Manager and Jerome Griffiths, Head of Human Resources review 

a selection of books during “Read Across Jamaica Day” at the school on May 7,2024. 
 

 
Sherian Macdonald, Corporate Senior Manager of Deals Management interacts with students of Carberry Court 

Special School during the reading of a story by her on “Read Across Jamaica Day” on May 7, 2024. 
 

 
Nigel Holness, Managing Director, CIBC Caribbean has some help from students of St. Francis Primary 

demonstrating how a frog jumps during his reading to them on “Read Across Jamaica Day” on May 7, 2024. 



 

 
Nigel Holness, Managing Director, CIBC Caribbean with students of St. Francis Primary following his reading to them 

on “Read Across Jamaica Day”, May 7, 2024. 
 

 
CIBC Caribbean’s Head of Human Resources, Jerome Griffiths interacts with students of Carberry Court Special 

School during the reading of a story to them on “Read Across Jamaica Day”, May 7, 2024. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



About CIBC Caribbean 
  
CIBC Caribbean is a relationship bank offering a full range of market leading financial services 
through our Corporate and Investment Banking, Personal and Business Banking and Wealth 
Management segments. We are located in twelve (12) countries around the Caribbean, 
providing the banking services through approximately 2,700 employees in 45 branches and 
offices. We are one of the largest regionally listed financial services institutions in the English 
and Dutch speaking Caribbean, with US$13 billion in assets and market capitalization of US$1 
billion. We also have a representative office in Hong Kong that provides business development 
and relationship management for our fund administration. The face of banking is changing igel 
throughout the world and CIBC Caribbean intends to lead these changes with the expertise, 
integrity and knowledge gained from banking in the Caribbean since 1836. 
 
CIBC Caribbean is a member of the CIBC Group. CIBC is a leading Canadian-based global 
financial institution with 11 million personal banking and business clients. Through our three 
major business units - Retail and Business Banking, Wealth Management and Capital Markets - 
CIBC offers a full range of products and services through its comprehensive electronic banking 
network, branches and offices across Canada with offices in the United States and around the 
world.  
 
For more information about CIBC Caribbean, visit www.cibcfcib.com , Facebook, Twitter , 
LinkedIn, Instagram or YouTube. 
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